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How to practise mindfulness 
Practising mindfulness can promote positive wellbeing for 
you and your learning community. 
 
How do you practise 
mindfulness? 

There are 2 main ways 

The first is ‘formal’ practice, otherwise known 
as mindfulness meditation. It involves being 
seated and paying attention to the present 
moment. This practice can last for a few 
minutes, up to an hour, or longer for some 
people.   

The second is ‘informal’ practice. This means 
being mindful while we’re doing things in our 
day-to-day lives. For example, this might be 
paying attention in class, while driving or 
washing dishes.  

Body scans and breathing meditation 

You can practise mindful meditation in different 
ways, such as moving attention through 
various parts of your body (a body scan) or 
concentrating on your breathing.  

When practising mindfulness in these ways, 
you may notice thoughts and feelings. If you 
feel able, you may choose to notice these with 
a sense of curiosity and non-judgement.  

If your attention wanders, you may like to bring 
your attention back to your body or breathing. 
It’s important to note that this practice may not 
suit everyone. Trying a new skill can feel 
uncomfortable. Be gentle with yourself and 
stop if you need to. You can always try again 
later. 

How to try breath meditation 

• let yourself be free of any expectations about 
how the meditation should go  

• adopt a relaxed but upright sitting posture 
with your eyes closed  

• when settled, using the sense of touch by 
placing your hand on your belly, focus your 
awareness on your breath  

• observe and acknowledge what you are 
experiencing in the moment. Do this without 
trying to change thoughts or feelings or to 
solve any problems that come to mind  

• as you breathe, focus on the point where the 
air enters and leaves your body 

• if thoughts or feelings arise that distract you, 
you may wish to gently refocus on your 
breath  
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• if you feel distressed or wish to stop, do so, 
and reach out to a trusted person if you need 
support. You can find a list of support 
services on this page 

• when you’re ready to finish, gently open your 
eyes, reconnect with the environment, and 
ease yourself into whatever needs your 
attention.  

You may like to start with 5 or 10 minutes of 
meditation once or twice a day. You can build it 
up as you become more comfortable with the 
practice. 

If your mind wanders 

You may find your thoughts wandering. That’s 
completely normal. There’s no need to criticise 
yourself if your mind wanders – just gently 
bring it back to your breathing each time. 
Repeatedly bringing your attention back to your 
breath and learning to be accepting and self-
compassionate creates a mindful state. 

You can practise mindfulness in everyday 

tasks 

You can take a mindful approach to everyday 
activities, no matter how mundane or simple. 
The informal practice of mindfulness is easy to 
build into your day. Next time you have a snack, 
take your time and focus on the feel, smell, 
taste and sensation of chewing. Bring your full 
awareness to the task of brushing your teeth or 
washing the dishes. The beauty of mindfulness 
is that you can do it anywhere, anytime, without 
any special equipment. 

Mindfulness practice in your 
setting 
Not all children or young people will be 
interested in, or engage with, mindfulness, and 
that’s OK. Offer it as an optional activity and 
invite children to take part in their own time. 

Mindfulness activities may support children 
and young people by: 

• increasing self-awareness, self-management, 
social awareness, relationship skills and 
improving decision-making   

• encouraging them to identify situations 
where mindfulness may be helpful  

• helping them focus on a particular skill (for 
example, self-awareness). 

When ending mindfulness practice in a learning 
community environment, take time to observe 
children and young people to identify if any 
have experienced strong feelings during the 
session. Consider checking in with them to 
provide help-seeking information and support. 

Consider providing information for 
families 

Involving families in understanding mindfulness 
means that they can discuss it with their child 
and consider how mindfulness activities may 
support their child’s learning.  

You may like to invite families to a mindfulness 
session. Smiling Mind has resources to develop 
your skills in leading mindfulness meditation. 
You may also like to talk to your leadership 
team about teaching mindfulness as part of 
your social and emotional curriculum. 

External links 
headspace: 6 ways to practise mindfulness 

Smiling Mind 

Support services 

Mindfulness may give rise to strong or 
uncomfortable feelings, for educators, children 
or young people. Here are some organisations 
that may be able to provide some support: 

• The Beyond Blue Support Service provides 
support any time of the day or night. To talk 
with a trained mental health professional, call 
1300 22 4636 

• headspace provides online support and 
counselling for young people aged 12 to 25 
on 1800 650 890 (9am to 1am daily) 

• Kids Helpline is a crisis support service for 
children and young people aged 5 to 25 on 
1800 55 1800 

• 13Yarn is a 24-hour dedicated support 
service for Aboriginal and Torres Strait 
Islander Peoples: 13 92 76 

For a complete list and downloadable posters 
for your learning community, visit Mental health 
services and support helplines. 

https://www.smilingmind.com.au/
https://headspace.org.au/explore-topics/for-young-people/mindfulness/
https://www.smilingmind.com.au/
http://www.beyondblue.org.au/get-support
https://headspace.org.au/
https://kidshelpline.com.au/
https://www.13yarn.org.au/
https://beyou.edu.au/resources/mental-health-services-and-support-helplines
https://beyou.edu.au/resources/mental-health-services-and-support-helplines
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